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Introduction

The intrauterine device (IUD) is a widely used method
of contraception. It is reliable when inserted by pro-
fessional health providers. Some complications such as
infection, expulsion and perforation are inevitable.
Uterine perforation caused by an IUD is an uncommon
complication that occurs in approximately 1/1,000
insertions.1 Uterine perforation might be considered as
the most important complication because it can lead to
either intrauterine or extrauterine pregnancy and can
even be life-threatening. Experiencing a pregnancy
while using an IUD will be at least demoralizing, and
when it happens to be an extrauterine pregnancy, the
consequences can be even more serious. The important
point is to keep patients in routine follow-up and to
encourage complaint-free women to stay on a regular
check-up schedule with their gynecologists.

Case Report

We present a 32-year-old woman, gravida 4, para 2,
who visited the gynecology outpatient clinic of Celal
Bayar University Faculty of Medicine in Manisa, Turkey.

She had no complaints and was undergoing her rou-
tine annual check-up. Her gynecological history re-
vealed dilatation and curettage twice for an indication
of missed abortion, 9 and 12 years before this visit, re-
spectively. She had undergone a cesarean section 4 and
9 years previously. She was using an IUD as a contra-
ceptive method. The IUD had been inserted 3 years
before by a gynecologist in another medical institu-
tion, and the patient had not experienced any discom-
fort whatsoever since then. She was menstruating with
a regular pattern and on her 8th menstrual day. On
gynecological examination, the perineum, vulva and
vagina were observed to be normal, the uterus was
retroverted and of normal size, and the adnexes were
non-palpable. On speculum examination, the cervix
was of nulliparous appearance and the string of the
IUD was seen at the external os. About 1.5 cm above
the cervical os, the copper end of the IUD was ob-
served protruding outwards from the cervix (Figure 1).
Transvaginal ultrasound showed a 5-mm endometrium,
a regular-appearing uterus and bilateral normal adnexa,
and a dislocated IUD. The patient was hospitalized.
Under general anesthesia, the IUD was removed from
the site of perforation. No complication occurred and
she was discharged on the following postoperative day.
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Discussion

The IUD is a highly safe and widely used contraceptive
method, but sometimes complications can occur. In-
fection is the most frequent complication seen in IUD
users, and ectopic pregnancy is another complication
that is often related to device dislocation.1 Perforation
of the uterus by an IUD is a rare but serious compli-
cation. IUD perforation of the uterus and migration to
the colon,2 bladder,3,4 ureter5 or fallopian tubes6 have
been reported. Such perforations are generally observed
when the insertion is performed promptly after vaginal
delivery or curettage. These patients generally complain
of abdominal pain or cramps, usually have menstrual
abnormalities, and even experience pregnancies. An
IUD that migrates to the bladder can cause extrauri-
nary symptoms such as chronic pelvic pain or urinary
symptoms such as pyuria or stone formation. When
the strings of the IUD are lost and the device cannot
be seen by ultrasonography, X-ray or tomography can
be used for visualization. In the present case, the IUD
and string were both observed at the cervical os. Signs
of an adverse medical condition can be regarded as an
opportunity for the patient to seek medical care.

However, it is more important to be on a regular check-
up schedule. In the case reported here, the patient had
no symptoms of menstrual irregularity, hematuria,
abdominal pain or dyspareunia. There were no symp-
toms related to the dislocated IUD. The routine check-
up examination for this patient prevented her from
becoming pregnant and spared the cervix from further
damage. As far as we are aware, there is only 1 case
reported in the literature with cervical perforation
caused by an IUD after methyl ergonovine maleate
administration.7 Our patient had completely sponta-
neous dislocation of the IUD with perforation of the
cervix. The time when the dislocation occurred remains
unknown.

IUDs must be inserted by a professional, and pa-
tients advised to undergo regular gynecological exam-
inations. It is also important to instruct patients about
self-examination. Our patient increased her chance of
preventing further complications by undergoing an
annual check-up.
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Figure 1. End of the IUD protruding outwards from the cervix.


